Clay County

Date Received:
Annual Usage:
Billing / Legal:

Fixed to Load Zone Offers

Jan 5t 2022
562,175 kWh
214 N. Main Henrietta, TX 76365

ESI IDs: 12
Start Date: Jan 2024

12 Month 24 Month

60 Month 82 Month 96 Mont

Suppliers 36 Month .48 Month 72 Month 84 Month

MP2 $0.04434  $0.04409  $0.04404 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BiD NO BID
NRG $0.04473 $0.04405 $0.04324 $0.04255 $0.04201 $0.04169 N $0.04153 $0.0414
™Xu $0.04446 $0.04386 $0.04285 $0.04208 $0.04136 $0.04076 (" $0.04044 0.04154 NO BID

Supp!ier Details

MP . MP2 Energy
MP2Energy.com
ENERGY o

832-510-1030

A Shell Energy North America Subsidiary

NRG
NRG.com
609-524-4500

TXU Energy
TXU.com
800-818-6132

o +1855-275-3483
D energyby5.com

Proposal #23943

Credit Approved
25% Bandwidth

Credit Approved

100% Bandwidth
Payment: 30

10% add/delete included

Credit Pending
25% Bandwidth
5% add/delete included, $800-2,300 Greenbacks available

4545 Fuller Drive, Suite 412 B
Irving, TX 75038

oK

Confidential. Created on Jan 07, 2022.



